[Invoice: ]
Invoice #:2023-0130
Invoice Date: 2023-04-12

P/O #:
\ Terms:NET 30
Make Payable To:
[Bill To: ] [ Make Pay _ |
Integrated Data Services
Tyler County AT99FM T1 E
116 S. Chariton Dike. TX 7543'7_
e,
Woodville, TX 75979 '
) (903) 243-1208
l Date QTY Units Description Rate Total
04/11/2023 Flat rate Annual Maintenance easyDocs/Docket : Flat Rate 1,500.00

0:00 - Total Hours Worked 1,500.00
0.0-  Total Travel Miles 0.00
Total Hardware (non-Taxed) 000
Total Hardwire (Taxed)  ------

Total 1,500.00

’

Subtotal 1,500.00
Prior Balance 0.00
Total Due 1,500.00
Less Payment ©.00
Balance Due 1,500,00



oice #:

Invoice Date: /
P/O #:
Terms: NET 30

Tyler County :;t;;}?:: 113;?’&\ Services
116 S. Charlton i o 7543-7
Woodville, TX 75979 W,
PR R NPT o ot oo
04/11/2023 Flat rate Annual Maintenance easyDocs/Docket Flat Rate 1,500.00
0:00 - Total Hours Worked 1,500.00 Subtotal 1,500.00

00-  Total Travel Miles 0.00 Prior Balance 0.00

Total Hardware (non-Taxed) 0.00 Total Due 1,500.00
Total Hardware (Taxed)  ------ Less Payment 0.00
Total 1,500.00 Balance Due 1,500.00

P2}

Ditr Wae st

Wildor@iniegaed - dato. . O



Invoice #:

Invoice Date:
P/O #:
Terms: NET 30
116 S. Charlton g 7543'7
Woodville, TX 75979 -
(903) 243-1208
04/11/2023 Flat rate Annual Maintenance easyDocs/Docket Flat Rate 1,500.00
0:00 - Total Hours Worked 1,500.00 Subtotal 1,500.00

00-  Total Travel Miles 0.00 Prior Balance 0.00
Total Hardware (non-Taxed) 0.00 Total Due 1,500.00
Total Hardware (Taxed)  ------ Less Payment 0.00
Total 1,500.00 Balance Due 1,500.00

AMOUNT
CODE NO.
VENDOR NO.
APPROVED -

\W \1 Uk@( @ N (g (ododdatoe. Com



SteEhanie Voth

From: Donece Gregory

Sent: Tuesday, April 11, 2023 1:52 PM
To: Stephanie Voth

Subject: FW: Annual Invoice
Attachments: Tyler2023.pdf

Stephanie,

| have printed this out and initialed and put in folder at the front counter. | was thinking that if | forwarded the pdf that
you could use it to drop into your software.

Tyler County Clerk

116 S. Charlton

Woodville, TX 75979

409-283-2281

dgregory.cc@co.tyler.tx.us _

From: wilder@integrated-data.com <wilder@integrated-data.com>

Sent: Tuesday, April 11, 2023 1:19 PM

To: Donece Gregory <dgregory.cc@co.tyler.tx.us>; dgregory.cc@co.tylertx.us; County Clerk's Office
<countyclerk.cc@co.tyler.tx.us>

Subject: Annual Invoice

I'm not sure which email is correct so | sent it to three. Would you mind letting me know which is best.
| hope your regional meeting went well. I'm sorry | wasn’t able to attend as | had a conflict.

Thanks

Bill Wilder

(903) 243-1208
www.easydocs.us

,ggye Virus-free. www.avg.com



